


Item No.: 19

CITY OF LOS ANGELES
CLAIMS BOARD

RECOMMENDATION OF THE CLAIMS BOARD
FOR CONSIDERATION BY THE CITY COUNCIL

The Honorable City Council
City of Los Angeles

Room 395, City Hall

200 North Spring Street
Los Angeles, CA 90012

Honorable Members:

At its meeting on November 7, 2022, the Claims Board of the City of Los

Angeles considered a report of the Department of Building and Safety in
the matter of:

Refund Claim From 11867 Jefferson, LLC — Linkage Fees re: Claim No. 160989

and voted ( 2/0 ) that your Honorable Body (approve/reject) the recommendation of
the Department of Building and Safety.

Other action:

Claims Board, City of Los Angeles

By: /s/ Kellilyn Porter
Chairperson

cc: City Attorney



11/7/22, 2:52 PM City of Los Angeles Mail - 11/7/22 Claims Board

Margarit Avesyan <margarit.avesyan@lacity.org>

11/7/22 Claims Board

Kelli Porter <kelli.porter@lacity.org> Mon, Nov 7, 2022 at 2:47 PM
To: Margarit Avesyan <margarit.avesyan@]Iacity.org>

The Claims Board approved items 2-21 by 2/0

Kellilyn Porter
Assistant City Attorney
Claims and Risk Management Division

City Hall East 1 200 N. Main Street, 8th Floor I Los Angeles, CA 900121 (213) 978-8373

*****************Confidentiality Notice *hkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkk

This electronic message transmission contains information

from the Office of the Los Angeles City Attorney, which may be confidential or protected by the attorney-client privilege
and/or the work product doctrine. If you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying,

distribution or use of the content of this information is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
notify us immediately by e-mail and delete the original message and any attachments without reading or saving in any
manner.
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11867 Jefferson, LLC & its attorney,

The Law Office of Steve Hoffman

fadnus 400

16 The Law Office of Steve Hoffman. 4929 Wilshire Bivd., Suite 410, Los Angeles, CA 90010

Hae Menmbat !

]

(323) 997-1188

REFUND INFORMATION
JOB LocaTiON: 11863 W. Jefferson Bivd, Los Angeles, CA 90230

(LADBS has been closed to public for Covid 19)
Amount Claimed § $80,731.20 Date Fees Paid: 11/23/21

RECEIPT #/PERMIT #/REFERENCE ¢ 19010 - 10000 - 04149 and 20019 - 10000 - 01000

See attached letter + Exhibits documenting that we are owed a Linkage Fee refund of $80,731.20.
We were charged on gross sq footage of 27,315 instead of net of 23,145 after 4,170 demo.
Because of the attached attorney's fee lien, please make the check payable to:

111867 Jefferson, LLC & Law Office of Steve Hoffman" and mail to 4929 Wilshire Bivd., #410, L.A., CA 90

10
NOTE: A Chaimant may be required to submit to examination under oztb. {Charter Section 217.)

Presentation of a false claimis & felony, (Californis Penal Code Seetion 72.)
I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE STATEMENTS ARE TRUE.
Steve Hoffman, Esq., Attorney for B O W
11867 Jefferson L& d ] AT February 25, 2022
SIGNATURE AND 117 1.E GF CLARMANT ] 4 DAL
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disability and. upon request, will provide reasonable accommadation to ensure equal access to its programs, services and aclivilies
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7127122, 11:50 AM Refund Claims
Wednesday, July 27, 2022 11: 50 AM
LADBS Recommendation Form
CLAIM # 160989 Document Number: 19010-10000-04149

Bureau: Engineering
Division: Green Building

Receipt Number:
. Receipt Date:

' Fee Period:
Job Address: 11863 W Jefferson BLVD 90230

1. Did LADBS perform any work for which the permit or receipt was issued?
yes

2. Are the reasons given by claimant correct?
yes

3. Did LADBS initiate an action that resulted in an error?
yes
Credit was not given for the demolished floor area.

4. Is this a duplicated permit or receipt of the same job or item?
no

5. Of the gross amount claimed, is the amount claimed pertaining to the(se) particular item(s) correct?
yes

6. Is a refund recommended?
yes
Credit was not given for the demolished floor area.

Reviewed By: TEODORO DIAZ RODRIGUEZ Financial Service Div.'s Comments:
Reviewed On: 07/07/2022

Approved By: CHARMIE HUYNH
Approved On: 07/20/2022

Linkage Fee Overcharged
Liaison's Comments:

Reviewer's Comments:
Supervisor's Comments:

History

Action By On

Review Approved & Returned to FSD CHARMIE HUYNH 7/20/2022 12:58:44 PM
E:ﬁ:‘:ﬂfgm’ﬁ:’:)& SbRkE or sperascrRawem (D TEODORO DIAZ RODRIGUEZ ~ 7/7/2022 1:19:49 PM
Assigned (to TEODORO DIAZ RODRIGUEZ) MARGARET KUHN 5/12/2022 1:27:23 PM
Created MARY SUM 5/12/2022 10:34:25 AM

https://vm-08wnetapp01/ClaimForRefund/EditView/RecomendFormPrint 1,1









STEVE A. HOFFMAN

Attorney At Law
4929 Wilshire Boulevard, Suite 410 Los Angeles, CA 90010
PHONE: (323) 997-1188 FAX: (323)937-1539
Email: hoffpi@sbcglobal.net Website: www.Hoffinanpi.com

DESIGNATION, LIEN, PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS
L AUTHORIZATION TO RELEASE RECORDS
11867 Jefferson, LLC hereby designates attorney Steve A. Hoffman to represent it in obtaining the

linkage fee refund for 11863 W. Jefferson Blvd LA, CA 90230, It further consents to have the City and

LADBS. release to Steve A. Hoffman, Esq.'s office. documents and information. regarding this matter.
LIEN: It grants Steve Hoffman, Esq. a lien on its linkage fee refunds for 11863 W. Jefferson

Bivd LA. CA 90230 and irrevocably requests that the refund check(s) be payable to

“11867 Jefferson, LLC & altorney Steve A. Holfman Trust Account™ and mailed (0 Steve Hollman,
Esq., at 4929 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 410, Los Angeles, CA 90010. This lien is only on the

nds/ov e T o e

DocuS| 3
Dated: N02/21/2022 By: @
MBI YARIYS)-Managing Officer of 11867 Jefferson, LLC
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11863 W Jefferson Blvd éﬁ&? Pormit 19010 - 10000 - 04149
: (1‘ ) E‘T ) Plan Check #: B19LA19852 Printed: 02/17/22 02:58 PM

Event Code:

Bldg-New GREEN - MANDATORY City of Los Angeles - Department of Building and Safety Issued on:  11/23/2021
Apartment

. APPLICATION FOR BUILDING PERMIT Last Status: Issued
Regular Plan Check
Plan Check AND CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY Status Date: 11/23/2021
L. TRACT BLOCK LOT(s) ARB  COUNTY MAP REF # PARCEL ID 2 (PIN #) 2, ASSESSOR PARCEL #
TR 8539 526 M B 104-53/55 105B165 305 4220 - 005 - 041
TR 8539 525 M B 104-53/55 105B165 310 4220 - 005 - 041
TR 8539 524 M B 104-53/55 10SB165 314 4220 - 005 - 040
TR 8539 523 M B 104-53/55 105B165 319 4220 - 005 - 040
TR 8539 522 M B 104-53/55 105B165 323 4220 - 005 - 039
A PARCEL INFORMATION )
Airport Hazard Area - 350" Height Limit Above Elevation 126 Census Tract - 2756.03 Thomas Brothers Map Grid - 672-F6
Alley - 20 District Map - 105B165 Area Planning Commission - West Los Angeles
LADBS Branch Office - WLA Energy Zone - 6 Earthquake-Induced Liquefaction Area - Yes
Council District - 11 Lot Size - 100'X124.88' Community Plan Area - Palms - Mar Vista - Del Rey
Certified Neighborhood Council - Del Rey Lot Type - Interior Near Source Zong Distance - 3.7

zoness:  R3-1

Applicant: (Relationship: Agent for Owner)

4. DOCUMENTS

Z1 - ZI-1874 LA Coastal Transportation Corric ORD - ORD-164177-SA6040 MODF - 09/09/20: TO ALLOW EGRESS ST. CPC - CPC-2005-8252-CA

ZI - Z1-2427 FWY Adj Advisory Notice for S« ORD - ORD-168999 MODF - 09/15/20: ROOFTOP PLANTERS 4 CPC - CPC-2014-1456-SP

ZI - ZI-2452 Transit Priority Arca in the Cit ORD - ORD-186104 MODF - 11-20-20: TAPERD MAT SLAB IN] CPC - CPC-2018-7547-CPU
SPA - Los Angeles Coastal Transportation Co MODF - 09/09/20: TO ALLOW EGRESS CQ CPC - CPC-1984-226-SP AFF - 20200878169: MAINT ROOFTOP PL/
5. CHECKLIST ITEMS

Special Inspect - Anchor Bolts Special Inspect - Structural Wood (continuous Permit Flag - Rec and Parks Fee Memo Regqd
Special Inspect - Impervious Methane Membrane Permit Flag - Fire Life Safety Clearnce Reqd Std. Work Descr - Seismic Gas Shut Off Valve
Special Inspect - Structural Observation Storm Water - LID Project

6. PROPERTY OWNER, TENANT, APPLICANT INFORMATION

Ownee(e

11867 JEFFERSON LLC 13101 WASHINGTON BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90066

Tenani:

MATT HEPBURN - 5150 WILSHIRE BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90036 (412) 818-6780
(05) Apartment NEW 4 STORY, TYPE VA/IA, 17 UNIT APARTMENT BUILDING OVER 1 LEVEL,
(07) Garage - Private TYPE 1A, SUBTERRANEAN PARKING. THE FIRST STORY IS, TYPEIA,
RESIDENTIAL AND PARKING GARAGE.
rm For inspection requests, call toll-free (888) LAABUILD (524-2845),
or request inspections via www.ladbs.org. To speak to 2 Call Center
e agent, call 311, Ourside LA County, call (213 473-3231.
BLDG.PCBy:  Kesete Haregot DAS PC By:
OK for Cashier:  Stella Sargsyan Coord. OK:
. For Cashier's Use Only W/O #: 91004149
Signature: Date:
VALUATIO J Final Fee Period
Permit Valuation:  $10,000,000 — PC Valuation:  $0 o
FINAL TOTAL Bldg-New 705,836.86 School District Residential Level 1 117,100.08
Permit Fee Subtotal Bldg-New 38,981.50 Dwelling Unit Construction Tax 3,400.00
Energy Surcharge Residential Development Tax 5,100.00
Handicapped Access CA Bldg Std Commission Surcharge 400.00
Plan Check Subtotal Bldg-New 0.00 Green Building

Off-hour Plan Check 0.00 Permit Issuing Fee 27.00

Plan Maintenance 300.00 Linkage Fee 528,818.40 Payment D | £
E.Q. Instrumentation 2,800.00 Receipt No: 20213 1-64
D.S.C. Surcharge 1,263.26 .

Sys. Surcharge 2,526.51 Amount: $705’83686

Planning Surcharge 235851 Method: ICL Check

Planning Surcharge Misc Fee 10.00

Planning Gen Plan Maint Surcharge 2,751.60 2021 LA01 576

Sewer Cap ID: Total Bond(s) Due:

lot Plan
*08001190101000004]49FN*

Signed Declaration







3/9/22, 2:07 PM https://ucs.insidela.org/ladbs_prod/my/0/0/0/a_search_result/network_printer —_print.htm?__DOUBLESUBMIT__=9fuV69TuFWs7Uly...

201 N. Figueroa St., 4th Floor
Los Angeles, CA 90012

Receipt
Your Reference Number:
2021327001-64
11/23/2021 1:13:33 PM
jbitangcol

TRANSACTIONS N
LADBS PERMIT $705,836.86
2021327001-64-1

Name: MATT HEPBURN

Job Address: 11863 W JEFFERSON BLVD

Permit Number: 19010-10000-04149

Building Permit Reference Number: 2021LA01576

Off-hour Plan Check $0.00
D.S.C. Surcharge $1263.26
Sys. Surcharge $2526.51
Planning Surcharge $2358.51
Planning Gen Plan Maint Surcharge $2751.60
Planning Surcharge Misc Fee $10.00
Permit Issuing Fee $27.00
Linkage Fee $528818.40
Dwelling Unit Construction Tax $3400.00
Residential Development Tax $5100.00
CA Bldg Std Commission Surcharge $400.00
School District Residential Level 1 $117100.08
Permit Fee Subtotal Bldg-New $38981.50
Plan Check Subtotal Bldg-New $0.00
Plan Maintenance $300.00
E.Q. Instrumentation $2800.00
Total Amount: $705,836.86
PAYMENT
ICL Check $705,836.86

Check Number: 0159

) L’A"‘\”#

htips://ucs.insidela.orglladbs_prod/my/0/0/0/a_search_result/network_printer - print.htm?__DOUBLESUBMIT__=9fuV69TuFWs7UtyRzgXr1Qq8BJSTe...  1/1



3/9/22, 2:07 PM

Image Display CORE Admin Center iPayment Enterprise 4.5.1.5.0_rv55583

iPayment Reference Number:

2021327001-64
Effective Date 11/23/2021
Workgroup Metro 4th Floor
User jbitangcol
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CLAIM FOR REFUND - PAYMENTS

CLAIM # 160989
TOTAL 20% NET
FEE FUND FUND AMOUNT RETENTION REFUND
TYPE TYPE PAID AMOUNT AMOUNT
B-PR 48R/08/3225/3239 AP10 | $ - $ - $ -
LINKAGE 59T/43/4680/468001 AP10 | $ 80,731.20 - $ 80,731.20
TOTAL $ 80,731.20 | $ - $ 80,731.20

AN
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